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The mountain town of Nugget, California, may be tiny, but with its breathtaking scenery, fresh air, and
lovable locals, it has everything. Not to mention it’s the perfect setting for firsts—and seconds—of all
kinds…
 
On the day of her glitzy New York City wedding, society girl Samantha Dunsbury ditches her Wall Street
groom, and hops in her convertible. Her only plan is to head west. But when a pit stop lands her at a lovely
Victorian inn in Nugget, she doesn’t want to leave. And when the innkeeper needs someone to fill in, Sam is
thrilled to take the job—her first! For once, she’s going to do what makes her happy. She just has to figure
out what happy looks like. She never expects it to look like her surly new boss…
 
The last thing Nate Breyer needs is a debutante dilettante mucking up his business. How his sister—and co-
owner—could’ve hired Sam is beyond him. Nate’s known women like Sam before—he was engaged to one
once. With no options, he’ll just have to keep his eye on her while also keeping his distance. But to his
surprise it turns out Sam’s got a knack for the job, and for putting folks at ease—including Nate. As
business—and pleasure—heat up their relationship, Nate finds himself ready to do anything to persuade the
runaway-bride to stay permanently gone…

Praise For Stacy Finz

“Finz is a unique new voice. Nugget, California is a charming small town filled with inventive characters and
sweet romance."--Jill Shalvis, New York Times bestselling author of the Lucky Harbor Series

"Tender and touching, Stacy Finz writes romance with heart."--Marina Adair, #1 National bestselling author
of Summer in Napa
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From reader reviews:

Angela Caves:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
so. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new data.
When you read a e-book you will get new information simply because book is one of various ways to share
the information as well as their idea. Second, reading through a book will make a person more imaginative.
When you reading a book especially hype book the author will bring you to imagine the story how the
personas do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other people. When you read this Starting
Over (A Nugget Romance Book 4), you are able to tells your family, friends and also soon about yours
guide. Your knowledge can inspire average, make them reading a e-book.

Wilbert Westerfield:

The e-book untitled Starting Over (A Nugget Romance Book 4) is the book that recommended to you to see.
You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to you. The language that creator use to
explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author was did a lot of exploration when write the book,
hence the information that they share for your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-
book of Starting Over (A Nugget Romance Book 4) from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free
time.

Rona Foret:

The e-book with title Starting Over (A Nugget Romance Book 4) posesses a lot of information that you can
learn it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This particular book exist new understanding the
information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to
yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you inside new era of
the syndication. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Wesley Baker:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information
easier to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspapers,
book, and soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. Typically the book
that recommended to you is Starting Over (A Nugget Romance Book 4) this publication consist a lot of the
information in the condition of this world now. That book was represented so why is the world has grown up.
The dialect styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some
investigation when he makes this book. Here is why this book appropriate all of you.
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