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Between the late 1880s and the onset of the Second World War, anti-slavery activism experienced a revival
in Europe. Anti-slavery organizations in Britain, Italy, France, and Switzerland forged an informal
international network to fight the continued existence of slavery and slave trading in Africa. Humanitarian
Imperialism explores the scope and outreach of these antislavery groups along with their organisational
efforts and campaigning strategies. The account focuses on the interwar years, when slavery in Africa
became a focal point of humanitarian and imperial interest, linking Catholic and Protestant philanthropists,
missionaries of different faiths, colonial officials, diplomats, and political leaders in Africa and Europe. At
the centre of the narrative is the campaign against slavery in Ethiopia, an issue which served as a catalyst for
the articulation of international humanitarian standards within the League of Nations in Geneva.

By looking at the interplay between British and Italian advocates of abolition, Humanitarian Imperialism
shows how in the 1930s anti-slavery campaigning evolved in close association with Fascist imperialism.
Thus, during the Italo-Ethiopian war of 1935, the anti-slavery argument became a propaganda tool to placate
public opinion in Britain and elsewhere. Because of its global echoes, however, the conflict also generated
worldwide protest that undermined the beliefs and certainties of anti-slavery campaigners, resulting in a
crisis of humanitarian imperialism. By following the story of anti-slavery activism into the post-1945 period,
this volume illuminates the continuities and discontinuities in the international history of humanitarian
organizations as well as the history of imperial humanitarianism.
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From reader reviews:

Timothy McCormack:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for us to
know everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or even goal; it means that publication has
different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They can be reading
whatever they have because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Consider the person who don't like
studying a book? Sometime, man feel need book after they found difficult problem or exercise. Well,
probably you will need this Humanitarian Imperialism: The Politics of Anti-Slavery Activism, 1880-1940
(Oxford Historical Monographs).

Jeffery Herring:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have considerably more or little spare time?
That's why, you can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their particular
spare time to take a stroll, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or read a book allowed
Humanitarian Imperialism: The Politics of Anti-Slavery Activism, 1880-1940 (Oxford Historical
Monographs)? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You already know beside you can spend your time
together with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have
various other opinion?

Michele Stoney:

The event that you get from Humanitarian Imperialism: The Politics of Anti-Slavery Activism, 1880-1940
(Oxford Historical Monographs) is a more deep you digging the information that hide into the words the
more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to understand but
Humanitarian Imperialism: The Politics of Anti-Slavery Activism, 1880-1940 (Oxford Historical
Monographs) giving you buzz feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their point in specific way that
can be understood through anyone who read the idea because the author of this book is well-known enough.
This particular book also makes your own vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then
can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for having this
particular Humanitarian Imperialism: The Politics of Anti-Slavery Activism, 1880-1940 (Oxford Historical
Monographs) instantly.

Andre Barrett:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with pals is thing that
usually you will have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you already been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Humanitarian
Imperialism: The Politics of Anti-Slavery Activism, 1880-1940 (Oxford Historical Monographs), it is



possible to enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of hang-out
type is it? Oh seriously its mind hangout people. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its referred to as
reading friends.
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