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...Reviews:

"While the Psalms of Solomon, dating from the middle of the first century B. C, have long been known, a
Syriac version of them has been found whose MS. is accompanied by the MS. of the hitherto unknown
collection here entitled 'The Odes of Solomon'—a document of higher antiquity than any other non-canonical
Christian writing. . . . These Odes are regarded as produced amidst Jewish-Christian influences, but, at least
in part, at a somewhat earlier date, and are justly pronounced 'a memorial of the first importance for rightly
understanding the beliefs and experiences of the primitive church.' " —Outlook

"The matter presented to us in this humble guise bids fair to stand forth as one of the greatest treasures of
early Christian literature. 1n the case of a work destined to be so widely discussed and to play so important a
role in the history of early Christian literature, one wonders what could have induced the experienced editor
to omit all indices. The fine reserve, the carefully judicial, conservative spirit so characteristic of the best
English scholarship of today, is not the least of the good qualities of this book." —M. Sprengling

"Dr. Harris's introduction, like his notes on the separate Odes, throws a flood of light on the topics to which
we have referred and many others. There is, however, likely to be much difference of opinion on not a few of
his details." —Bible World

"We may congratulate ourselves that this first English version of the Odes is the work of a scholar of so
much literary feeling as Dr. Harris. He has nobly interpreted these beautiful works of religion. We only
regret that the editor has given us no index of his work or the Odes. Patristic study in particular is indebted
afresh to Dr. Harris for a new monument of the greatest antiquity and interest." —E. J. Goodspeed (Bible
World)

"I have endeavoured to do honour to the gifted editor even while criticising him. Able and instructive (even
on folklore) as Dr. Harris's introduction is, it suffers through his not having recognized that the passages
which are most plainly Christian are interpolations." —T. K. Cheyne

"A notable addition has been made to our scanty collection of early Christian books." —Outlook
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From reader reviews:

Sheila Foxworth:

Reading a guide tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world can easily share their
idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their very own reader with
their story or even their experience. Not only the story that share in the publications. But also they write
about advantage about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to
teach your kids, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors in this world always try to
improve their skill in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write for their book. One of
them is this The Odes and Psalms of Solomon.

Herbert Willams:

The publication with title The Odes and Psalms of Solomon includes a lot of information that you can learn
it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This kind of book exist new understanding the
information that exist in this guide represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to
yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you throughout new era of
the globalization. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Adrienne Helms:

Often the book The Odes and Psalms of Solomon has a lot of information on it. So when you check out this
book you can get a lot of gain. The book was published by the very famous author. The author makes some
research before write this book. This particular book very easy to read you may get the point easily after
perusing this book.

Robert Journey:

In this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability to do something more are more precious
than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple method to have that. What you have to do
is just spending your time not much but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of the books in
the top checklist in your reading list is usually The Odes and Psalms of Solomon. This book that is certainly
qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in growing to be precious person. By looking right up
and review this e-book you can get many advantages.
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