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This book is an autobiographical account of George Mandler--born in 1924--who grew up in a middle class
Jewish family in Vienna. It details the fears and attempts to find a safe haven when Austria was invaded and
absorbed into Nazi Germany in 1938, followed by Mandler's escape to England and residence in a small
boarding school. The threat of the holocaust and reaction to anti-semitism are explored and the author
describes the life of an emigre youth group run by a branch of the Austrian communist party. Drafted in
1943, Mandler is trained in military intelligence and ends up as a front line interrogator with the 7th army in
Germany. The training and function of military intelligence and the role of German and Austrian refugees in
it are described for the first time in detail. Military intelligence and counter-intelligence work in post-war
Germany follows, including the evacuation of a scientific establishment before the arrival of the Soviets.

Returning to New York in 1946, Mandler begins his college training at New York University and the
University of Basel, Switzerland. This is followed by graduate training in psychology at Yale and a first
position at Harvard for seven years. Highlights of the period include a short episode of peripheral
involvement in a Soviet spy scandal. After five years at the University of Toronto, Mandler is given the
opportunity of a lifetime--to start a department at the prestigious new San Diego branch of the University of
California. He describes the process of building a department and a university in the context of the 1960s, as
well as academic life and actions during the turbulent 60s and 70s. Mandler's successful career as a writer
and researcher in psychology is described in lay language, as is the professional/scientific bifurcation of the
field. The final chapter comments on and describes current academic life and problems.
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From reader reviews:

Ronald Finch:

The publication untitled Interesting Times: An Encounter With the 20th Century 1924- is the book that
recommended to you to read. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to
anyone. The language that writer use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The
author was did a lot of exploration when write the book, hence the information that they share for you is
absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of Interesting Times: An Encounter With the 20th
Century 1924- from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Joan Jackson:

This Interesting Times: An Encounter With the 20th Century 1924- is great book for you because the content
which can be full of information for you who else always deal with world and also have to make decision
every minute. This kind of book reveal it details accurately using great arrange word or we can say no
rambling sentences within it. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it
only gives you straight forward sentences but difficult core information with attractive delivering sentences.
Having Interesting Times: An Encounter With the 20th Century 1924- in your hand like having the world in
your arm, info in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say that no guide that offer you world throughout ten or
fifteen minute right but this publication already do that. So , this is certainly good reading book. Heya Mr.
and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt this?

Annie Fowler:

Reading a book to become new life style in this season; every people loves to go through a book. When you
study a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what types
of book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your analysis, you can read education
books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this kind of us novel,
comics, along with soon. The Interesting Times: An Encounter With the 20th Century 1924- offer you a new
experience in reading a book.

Thomas Rice:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
simpler to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and
soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended for you is Interesting Times: An Encounter With the 20th Century 1924- this e-book consist a
lot of the information from the condition of this world now. That book was represented how do the world has
grown up. The language styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made



some research when he makes this book. Here is why this book suited all of you.
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