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Spencer has been exchanging emails with Emma, a girl he met through an on-line dating service. After
corresponding to each other all summer, Spencer finally decides it’s time to meet. He invites her to be a
guest on the Dude Ranch.

Emma is thrilled to get out of New York City and spend some time in the rocky mountains. As each day
passes, she grows to love the ranch and surrounding land. She also starts to love Spencer. But even though he
is showing interest in her, he treats her more like a friend than someone he might want to have a deeper
relationship with.

Then Spencer receives distressing news about his father’s death. Will he be able to move past it and make a
commitment to Emma?

Other Books in this series:
Colorado Dreams
Colorado Secrets
Colorado Destiny
Colorado Dawn

Coming Soon: Sheridan’s story
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From reader reviews:

Mary Davis:

Colorado Skies: A Clean Western Romance (Majestic Mountain Ranch Romances, Book 5) can be one of
your beginning books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this e-book has
good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but
nevertheless delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her effort to get every word into
pleasure arrangement in writing Colorado Skies: A Clean Western Romance (Majestic Mountain Ranch
Romances, Book 5) however doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest and also based
confirm resource info that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great information could drawn you into
brand-new stage of crucial considering.

William Delacruz:

You may spend your free time to study this book this publication. This Colorado Skies: A Clean Western
Romance (Majestic Mountain Ranch Romances, Book 5) is simple to deliver you can read it in the area, in
the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not get much space to bring the particular printed book, you can
buy the e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. Therefore
there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Gay Swiderski:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you may have it in e-
book approach, more simple and reachable. This specific Colorado Skies: A Clean Western Romance
(Majestic Mountain Ranch Romances, Book 5) can give you a lot of close friends because by you
considering this one book you have issue that they don't and make an individual more like an interesting
person. That book can be one of a step for you to get success. This guide offer you information that might be
your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than other make you to be great individuals. So , why
hesitate? Let's have Colorado Skies: A Clean Western Romance (Majestic Mountain Ranch Romances, Book
5).

Erin Wright:

A lot of publication has printed but it is unique. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose
the top book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is named of book
Colorado Skies: A Clean Western Romance (Majestic Mountain Ranch Romances, Book 5). You can add
your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it could possibly add your knowledge and
make an individual happier to read. It is most essential that, you must aware about book. It can bring you
from one location to other place.
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