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This Pride and Prejudice variation, a short novella, explores a simple question: What if Lady Catherine was
just a little more rude, prompting Mr. Darcy to make a more Persuasion-esque proposal?

Readers considering this work should be aware of three things: That it is not the sequel to A Constant Love
(said sequel is still forthcoming); that unlike the Constant Love series, it is written in the present tense; and
that it uses lines from Jane Austen's Persuasion as well as Pride and Prejudice.

Readers who have not read Persuasion should read that novel first, less because of spoilers than because it is
absolutely wonderful.
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From reader reviews:

Patricia Skinner:

The ability that you get from Less Proud and More Persuasive: A Pride and Prejudice Variation Novella is
the more deep you excavating the information that hide within the words the more you get serious about
reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to comprehend but Less Proud and More Persuasive: A
Pride and Prejudice Variation Novella giving you buzz feeling of reading. The copy writer conveys their
point in a number of way that can be understood by simply anyone who read that because the author of this
book is well-known enough. That book also makes your own personal vocabulary increase well. It is
therefore easy to understand then can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We
highly recommend you for having that Less Proud and More Persuasive: A Pride and Prejudice Variation
Novella instantly.

Alexandria Sharp:

Typically the book Less Proud and More Persuasive: A Pride and Prejudice Variation Novella will bring you
to definitely the new experience of reading some sort of book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very
unique. In case you try to find new book you just read, this book very suitable to you. The book Less Proud
and More Persuasive: A Pride and Prejudice Variation Novella is much recommended to you you just read.
You can also get the e-book from the official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Benjamin Munk:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is different. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the
most effective book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is called
of book Less Proud and More Persuasive: A Pride and Prejudice Variation Novella. You can contribute your
knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it can add your knowledge and make you actually
happier to read. It is most important that, you must aware about publication. It can bring you from one
destination for a other place.

Michael Sherman:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
from a book. Book is prepared or printed or created from each source in which filled update of news. Within
this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media
social including newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
in search of the Less Proud and More Persuasive: A Pride and Prejudice Variation Novella when you
required it?
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