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In My Forty Years with Ford, Charles Sorensen-sometimes known as "Henry Ford's man," sometimes as
"Cast-iron Charlie"-tells his own story, and it is as challenging as it is historic. He emerges as a man who
was not only one of the great production geniuses of the world but also a man who called the plays as he saw
them. He was the only man who was able to stay with Ford for almost the full history of his empire, yet he
never hesitated to go against Ford when he felt the interests of the company demanded it. When labor
difficulties mounted and Edsel's fatal illness was upon him, Sorensen sided with Edsel against Henry Ford
and Harry Bennett, and he insisted that Henry Ford II be brought in to direct the company despite the aging
founder's determination that no one but he hold the presidential reins.

First published in 1956, My Forty Years with Ford has now been reissued in paperback for the first time. The
Ford story has often been discussed in print but has rarely been articulated by someone who was there. Here
Sorensen provides an eyewitness account of the birth of the Model T, the early conflicts with the Dodge
brothers, the revolutionary announcement of the five-dollar day, and Sorensen's development of the moving
assembly line-a concept that changed our world. Although Sorensen conceived, designed, and built the giant
Willow Run plant in nineteen months and then proceeded to turn out eight thousand giant bombers, his life's
major work was to make possible the vision of Henry Ford and to postpone the personal misfortune with
which it ended. My Forty Years with Ford is both a personal history of a business empire and a revelation
that moves with excitement and the power of tragedy.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Herndon:

The book My Forty Years with Ford (Great Lakes Books Series) make you feel enjoy for your spare time.
You may use to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you
getting tension or having big problem along with your subject. If you can make looking at a book My Forty
Years with Ford (Great Lakes Books Series) to become your habit, you can get considerably more
advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about a number of or all subjects. You can know
everything if you like wide open and read a book My Forty Years with Ford (Great Lakes Books Series).
Kinds of book are several. It means that, science publication or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you
think about this e-book?

Jill Goulet:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they're still students or that for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that question above. Every person has
distinct personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they don't
would like do that. You must know how great and also important the book My Forty Years with Ford (Great
Lakes Books Series). All type of book would you see on many solutions. You can look for the internet
resources or other social media.

Nicol Thomas:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their free time with their family,
or their very own friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic
from the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different to
fill your own free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book could be option to fill your cost-free time/ holiday.
The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to try look
for book, may be the guide untitled My Forty Years with Ford (Great Lakes Books Series) can be excellent
book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

George Chadwick:

The book untitled My Forty Years with Ford (Great Lakes Books Series) contain a lot of information on that.
The writer explains your girlfriend idea with easy way. The language is very clear and understandable all the
people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was published by famous author. The
author provides you in the new period of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can
please read on your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. In a
situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site in addition to order it.
Have a nice study.
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