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With more than 9 million books sold, My Weird School really gets kids reading!

In this fourth book in the new My Weirdest School series, the students of Ella Mentry School are learning
about fire safety. Mrs. Meyer of the local fire department has been brought in to teach the students, but she is
the weirdest safety expert in the world. She likes fire just a little too much. Will Mrs. Meyer catch on fire?
Will she retire? What will transpire?

Perfect for reluctant readers and word lovers alike, Dan Gutman's hugely popular My Weird School series
has something for everyone. Don't miss the hilarious adventures of A.J. and the gang.
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From reader reviews:

Leta Welter:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students as they are still students or it for all people in the world,
the particular best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
various personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they
don't need do that. You must know how great as well as important the book My Weirdest School #4: Mrs.
Meyer Is on Fire!. All type of book is it possible to see on many options. You can look for the internet
resources or other social media.

Ralph Garibay:

This My Weirdest School #4: Mrs. Meyer Is on Fire! book is just not ordinary book, you have after that it the
world is in your hands. The benefit you get by reading this book is actually information inside this reserve
incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get. This
kind of My Weirdest School #4: Mrs. Meyer Is on Fire! without we understand teach the one who looking at
it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't become worry My Weirdest School #4: Mrs. Meyer Is
on Fire! can bring any time you are and not make your case space or bookshelves' grow to be full because
you can have it in the lovely laptop even cell phone. This My Weirdest School #4: Mrs. Meyer Is on Fire!
having good arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Gertrude Barrett:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this My Weirdest School #4: Mrs. Meyer Is on
Fire! reserve written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that may be understand by
anyone who else read the book. Written with good manner for you, dripping every ideas and writing skill
only for eliminate your own hunger then you still skepticism My Weirdest School #4: Mrs. Meyer Is on Fire!
as good book not only by the cover but also from the content. This is one reserve that can break don't
evaluate book by its cover, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your
examining sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.

Madeline Cecil:

Publication is one of source of know-how. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen will need book to know the change information of year to year. As we know those
ebooks have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. With
the book My Weirdest School #4: Mrs. Meyer Is on Fire! we can take more advantage. Don't you to
definitely be creative people? Being creative person must choose to read a book. Just simply choose the best
book that suited with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life with that book My Weirdest School
#4: Mrs. Meyer Is on Fire!. You can more desirable than now.
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