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"Someone must have been telling lies about Josef K., he knew he had done nothing wrong but, one morning,
he was arrested." From its gripping first sentence onward, this novel exemplifies the term ""Kafkaesque." Its
darkly humorous narrative recounts a bank clerk's entrapment — based on an undisclosed charge — in a
maze of nonsensical rules and bureaucratic roadblocks.
Written in 1914 and published posthumously in 1925, Kafka's engrossing parable about the human condition
plunges an isolated individual into an impersonal, illogical system. Josef K.'s ordeals raise provocative, ever-
relevant issues related to the role of government and the nature of justice. This inexpensive edition of one of
the 20th century's most important novels features an acclaimed translation by David Wyllie. 
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From reader reviews:

Tasha Page:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like looking
for your favorite e-book and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add your
knowledge by the book entitled The Trial (Dover Thrift Editions). Try to face the book The Trial (Dover
Thrift Editions) as your buddy. It means that it can being your friend when you really feel alone and beside
that of course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you much
more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , let's make new experience and
knowledge with this book.

Herbert Haubrich:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. As
it is known to us that book is very important for people. The book The Trial (Dover Thrift Editions) had been
making you to know about other information and of course you can take more information. It is very
advantages for you. The book The Trial (Dover Thrift Editions) is not only giving you a lot more new
information but also to become your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your own spend time
to read your guide. Try to make relationship using the book The Trial (Dover Thrift Editions). You never
truly feel lose out for everything if you read some books.

Fred Miller:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information currently can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider when those information which is within the former life are difficult to be find than now's taking
seriously which one works to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable
resource then you understand it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take The Trial (Dover Thrift Editions) as the daily
resource information.

Karen Baskin:

As a pupil exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library or make
summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's spirit or real their
leisure activity. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to go to the library. They go to right now there
but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring and also can't see
colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we
know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore this The Trial (Dover Thrift Editions) can make you sense more interested to
read.
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