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William Sydney Porter (1862 –1910), known by his pen name O. Henry, was an American short story writer.
O. Henry’s short stories are known for their wit, wordplay, warm characterization, and surprise endings. In
his day, he was called the American answer to Guy de Maupassant. While both authors wrote plot twist
endings, O. Henry stories were considerably more playful. His stories are also known for witty narration.
Most of O. Henry’s stories are set in his own time, the early 20th century. Many take place in New York City
and deal for the most part with ordinary people: clerks, policemen, waitresses, etc. O. Henry’s work is wide-
ranging, and his characters can be found roaming the cattle-lands of Texas, exploring the art of the con-man,
or investigating the tensions of class and wealth in turn-of-the-century New York. O. Henry had an
inimitable hand for isolating some element of society and describing it with an incredible economy and grace
of language. Some of his best and least-known work is contained in Cabbages and Kings, a series of stories
each of which explores some individual aspect of life in a paralytically sleepy Central American town, while
advancing some aspect of the larger plot and relating back one to another.
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From reader reviews:

Guadalupe Winn:

The book Rolling Stones gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your
capable far more increase. Book can to be your best friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem
together with your subject. If you can make reading through a book Rolling Stones being your habit, you can
get considerably more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about a number
of or all subjects. You are able to know everything if you like available and read a e-book Rolling Stones.
Kinds of book are several. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you
think about this guide?

Joseph Cash:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be up-date about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era and that is always change and make progress. Some of
you maybe will probably update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for you personally but
the problems coming to an individual is you don't know what type you should start with. This Rolling Stones
is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want
and wish in this era.

Terrie Delgadillo:

Reading a book to be new life style in this yr; every people loves to read a book. When you learn a book you
can get a wide range of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, due to the fact
book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that you
have read. If you would like get information about your research, you can read education books, but if you
act like you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics, along
with soon. The Rolling Stones provide you with new experience in reading through a book.

Roberta Haile:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you might have it in
e-book method, more simple and reachable. This specific Rolling Stones can give you a lot of close friends
because by you looking at this one book you have factor that they don't and make an individual more like an
interesting person. This specific book can be one of a step for you to get success. This guide offer you
information that possibly your friend doesn't learn, by knowing more than additional make you to be great
individuals. So , why hesitate? We should have Rolling Stones.
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