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THREE MONTHS. IT WAS ONLY FOR THREE MONTHS. My name is Emma Knight and I’m a twenty-
four-year-old woman who was moving from Miami to New York to pursue my dream of attending Parsons
School of Design. My plan was set in motion. I was packed and already on my way when I met a man and
received an email, both of which altered my plans and changed the course of my life. Max Hamilton, a
twenty-five-year-old, panty-melting, rich playboy who was being groomed to take over Hamilton Securities,
told me it was for only three months. His proposed deal was that I had to pose as his fiancée until his twenty-
sixth birthday so he could collect his trust fund. I’d help him and, in return, he’d help me achieve my dream.
It was a win-win situation, right? WRONG. Love was never part of the deal and neither was the secret that
Max could never find out about.
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From reader reviews:

Clarence Nelson:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a book. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the guide entitled His Proposed Deal. Try to make book His Proposed Deal as your good
friend. It means that it can to get your friend when you sense alone and beside regarding course make you
smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you a lot more
confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So , we need to make new experience in
addition to knowledge with this book.

Daniel Metz:

Book will be written, printed, or created for everything. You can know everything you want by a reserve.
Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important factor to bring us around the world.
Beside that you can your reading talent was fluently. A book His Proposed Deal will make you to always be
smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about every little thing. But some of you think
that open or reading the book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they might be thought like that?
Have you looking for best book or suited book with you?

Sarah Heath:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will
make someone to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
simpler to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and
soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. Typically the book that
recommended for your requirements is His Proposed Deal this e-book consist a lot of the information with
the condition of this world now. That book was represented how does the world has grown up. The
terminology styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some
exploration when he makes this book. That is why this book suited all of you.

Eugene Howard:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book seemed to be
rare? Why so many problem for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy intended for
reading. Some people likes studying, not only science book but novel and His Proposed Deal or perhaps
others sources were given understanding for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel would like
to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those ebooks
are helping them to bring their knowledge. In additional case, beside science publication, any other book
likes His Proposed Deal to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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