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It’s 1948, and postwar Rome is giddy and chaotic. Poet Dante Sabat is attending yet another film industry
soirée at Tullio Merlini’s apartment off the Via del Corso. Disaffected and deeply self-absorbed, Dante finds
Tullio’s glamorous evenings tedious but welcomes any distraction. This rainy evening, the distraction is
double: sisters Gladys and Prudence Godfrey, both beautiful, sharp-witted, and remarkably compelling
American actresses who have recently arrived in Rome. As the new acquaintances leave the party together, it
marks the beginning of a story of three damaged people struggling to live with their memories, and with
themselves.
Exhausted by fascism and the Second World War, Dante finds refuge in the hope offered by the resurgent
cinema, by American literature, and, in particular, by the pragmatic optimism and sexual energy of his
American lovers. But after decades of struggling to defend the fallibility of his art, his nation, his family, and
his own humanity, he remains convinced that the best expression of hope is to give up his life. The question
for Dante is: Can Gladys and Prudence change his mind? Will he let them?
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From reader reviews:

Dolores Stiger:

The book A Man of No Moon: A Novel gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can
utilize to make your capable far more increase. Book can to get your best friend when you getting strain or
having big problem with your subject. If you can make reading a book A Man of No Moon: A Novel to
become your habit, you can get a lot more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your
knowledge about some or all subjects. You could know everything if you like open and read a reserve A
Man of No Moon: A Novel. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or some
others. So , how do you think about this guide?

Randell Easley:

As people who live in often the modest era should be change about what going on or data even knowledge to
make these individuals keep up with the era which can be always change and make progress. Some of you
maybe can update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming
to an individual is you don't know what kind you should start with. This A Man of No Moon: A Novel is our
recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and need in
this era.

Gertrude Barrett:

The reason? Because this A Man of No Moon: A Novel is an unordinary book that the inside of the
publication waiting for you to snap it but latter it will surprise you with the secret this inside. Reading this
book alongside it was fantastic author who all write the book in such incredible way makes the content
within easier to understand, entertaining method but still convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you
because of not hesitating having this any more or you going to regret it. This phenomenal book will give you
a lot of gains than the other book have got such as help improving your ability and your critical thinking
means. So , still want to hold off having that book? If I were you I will go to the reserve store hurriedly.

Joseph Moody:

A Man of No Moon: A Novel can be one of your beginning books that are good idea. We recommend that
straight away because this book has good vocabulary which could increase your knowledge in vocabulary,
easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the information. The article author giving
his/her effort to set every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing A Man of No Moon: A Novel
nevertheless doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest and based confirm resource data that
maybe you can be among it. This great information could drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial
imagining.
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