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Recently discovered and never before published, these two short novels were written in the early 1970s, at
the beginning of Kathy Acker's writing career. Rip-off Red reads as a kind of Raymond Chandler for bad
girls, as Acker's typical literary playfulness transforms the genre conventions of detective fiction into a book
that is simultaneously a mystery and a personal, raunchy, and politically astute account of life in New York
City. The Burning Bombing of America is a dystopian vision of the destruction of America, combining
crypto-Socialist class critique with the visceral surreality of the Book of Revelation. Published together here,
they reveal a young writer on a literary romp, imposing an original, sexy, and subversive worldview that is
unmistakably Acker. They are a perfect introduction to Acker's oeuvre and essential for all Acker readers.
"Kathy Acker's trancelike writing style peels away the layers of reality." -- San Francisco Chronicle
"America's most beloved transgressive novelist." -- Spin "Acker is a postmodern Colette with echoes of
Cleland's Fanny Hill." -- William S. Burroughs
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From reader reviews:

Allen Brown:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can
add your knowledge by the e-book entitled Rip-Off Red, Girl Detective and The Burning Bombing of
America (Acker, Kathy). Try to stumble through book Rip-Off Red, Girl Detective and The Burning
Bombing of America (Acker, Kathy) as your close friend. It means that it can to get your friend when you
truly feel alone and beside that of course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your
needs. The book makes you considerably more confidence because you can know every thing by the book.
So , let me make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Graciela Johnson:

As people who live in the modest era should be update about what going on or information even knowledge
to make these individuals keep up with the era and that is always change and make progress. Some of you
maybe can update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems
coming to you is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Rip-Off Red, Girl Detective and The
Burning Bombing of America (Acker, Kathy) is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world.
Why, because this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Jessie Nathan:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This particular book Rip-Off Red, Girl Detective and The Burning
Bombing of America (Acker, Kathy) was vibrant and of course has pictures around. As we know that book
Rip-Off Red, Girl Detective and The Burning Bombing of America (Acker, Kathy) has many kinds or
category. Start from kids until teenagers. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read
and think that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it can
make you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading in which.

Dean Green:

As a pupil exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library in order
to make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's heart and
soul or real their pastime. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to go to the library. They go to
generally there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring
as well as can't see colorful images on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important to suit
your needs. As we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word
says, ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore this Rip-Off Red, Girl Detective and The Burning Bombing
of America (Acker, Kathy) can make you sense more interested to read.
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