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The lives of thousands of people have been influenced by Gangaji's teachings. You Are That is a collection
of her classic offerings, first shared more than a decade ago and now updated to include both original
volumes, a new introduction, rare photographs, and new insights. This exquisite special edition delves into
natural inquiries about our existence, including the nature of mind, how to expose the core of suffering, and
how to overcome the last obstacle of self-doubt. Eloquent and direct, Gangaji guides practitioners of all
backgrounds through an examination into the self that often leads to unexpected glimpses of awakening.
''This is a moment of reckoning,'' she teaches. ''Do not take this moment casually or trivially. Recognize that
for whatever reason, you are aware of the possibility of realizing the truth of yourself as limitless
consciousness - you are that!''
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From reader reviews:

Sabra Fitzgerald:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information better
to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and soon. You
can view that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The book that recommended to you is
You Are That (Large Print 16pt) this publication consist a lot of the information of the condition of this
world now. This book was represented how do the world has grown up. The words styles that writer make
usage of to explain it is easy to understand. Often the writer made some analysis when he makes this book.
Here is why this book acceptable all of you.

Betty Brown:

Beside this You Are That (Large Print 16pt) in your phone, it could give you a way to get nearer to the new
knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh from the oven so don't
become worry if you feel like an older people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have You Are That
(Large Print 16pt) because this book offers for you readable information. Do you often have book but you
would not get what it's all about. Oh come on, that wil happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable
blend here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss that? Find
this book in addition to read it from at this point!

Douglas Johnson:

Is it you who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by watching television programs or just lying
on the bed? Do you need something new? This You Are That (Large Print 16pt) can be the response, oh how
comes? A fresh book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your free time by reading in this brand-
new era is common not a geek activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?

Susan Garrard:

As a student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or even make
summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's heart or real their leisure
activity. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time there but
nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring as well as can't see
colorful images on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know
that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this You Are That (Large Print 16pt) can make you sense more interested to read.
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