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How do you light that spark in your life, when it’s just about to go
out?

Jennifer and Blake Simmons are a young, married couple living in Toronto. They have a good life together,
but they’ve been finding themselves feeling bored, listless — as though something in their lives is missing,
and they don’t know how to get it back.

One night, at a party for Jennifer’s work, they meet a new couple, Desmond and Haley Belanger. These two
seem happy, fulfilled — everything that Jennifer and Blake want. And it just so happens that Desmond and
Haley know how to bring that spark back into this Jennifer and Blake’s life.

Now these two are finding themselves at the start of a journey, one that will change their marriage forever —
but not necessarily for the good. Join them in the first instalment of a new series by Ellie Cummings, A
Hotwife’s Journey!

Want to read more? Click Look Inside for a steamy excerpt from my story!
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From reader reviews:

Claire Underwood:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With reading through you can get a lot
of information that can give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world can easily share their
idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their particular reader with
their story as well as their experience. Not only the story that share in the publications. But also they write
about the knowledge about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how
to teach your young ones, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors in this world always
try to improve their skill in writing, they also doing some research before they write to their book. One of
them is this New To This (A Hotwife's Journey Book 1).

Linda Hupp:

You could spend your free time you just read this book this publication. This New To This (A Hotwife's
Journey Book 1) is simple to create you can read it in the park, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did
not get much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you easier
to read it. You can save the book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get
when one buys this book.

Shelia Tonn:

Is it you actually who having spare time and then spend it whole day through watching television programs
or just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This New To This (A Hotwife's Journey Book 1) can
be the response, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your spare
time by reading in this fresh era is common not a nerd activity. So what these guides have than the others?

Veda Howard:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you will get it in
e-book approach, more simple and reachable. This specific New To This (A Hotwife's Journey Book 1) can
give you a lot of friends because by you considering this one book you have matter that they don't and make
you actually more like an interesting person. This kind of book can be one of one step for you to get success.
This book offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't understand, by knowing more than some
other make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? We need to have New To This (A Hotwife's
Journey Book 1).
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