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It is 1945, and courageous ten-year-old Sookan and her family must endure the cruelties of the Japanese
military occupying Korea.  Police captain Narita does his best to destroy everything of value to the family,
but he cannot break their spirit.  Sookan's father is with the resistance movement in Manchuria and her older
brothers have been sent away to labor camps.  Her mother is forced to supervise a sock factory and Sookan
herself must wear a uniform and attend a Japanese school.

Then the war ends.  Out come the colorful Korean silks and bags of white rice.  But Communist Russian
troops have taken control of North Korea and once again the family is suppressed.  Sookan and her family
know their only hope for freedom lies in a dangerous escape to Americancontrolled South Korea.

Here is the incredible story of one family's love for each other and their determination to risk everything to
find freedom.
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From reader reviews:

Shirley Gilliam:

The ability that you get from Year of Impossible Goodbyes is the more deep you looking the information
that hide into the words the more you get interested in reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to
comprehend but Year of Impossible Goodbyes giving you buzz feeling of reading. The author conveys their
point in a number of way that can be understood by simply anyone who read this because the author of this
guide is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. Making
it easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We
recommend you for having this specific Year of Impossible Goodbyes instantly.

Cheryl Fisher:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always aim to and must have the spare time or they will get lot of
stress from both way of life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we question again, what kind of
activity do you possess when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will probably
unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative in spending
your spare time, the actual book you have read is usually Year of Impossible Goodbyes.

Joseph Mattos:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside along with friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by reading through a book.
Ugh, do you think reading a book will surely hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It all right
you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Year of Impossible
Goodbyes which is having the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's find.

Theresa Nash:

On this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more special than other.
Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple method to have that. What you should do is
just spending your time not much but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of several books
in the top checklist in your reading list is Year of Impossible Goodbyes. This book which can be qualified as
The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in growing to be precious person. By looking upward and review
this book you can get many advantages.
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