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“Life imitates art far more than art imitates Life.” Oscar Wilde Author Nicola Royse dreamed of Scottish
Highlanders as a teen then wrote about them as an adult. Always looking but never finding her own White
Knight, she still held out hope that he would one day ride up on his trusty steed. He rode up all right, on a
silver Harley with heat in his eyes and a detective's badge on his hip while she and her friends plotted her
first contemporary romantic suspense. Of course, life couldn't' imitate art without a killer on the loose, one
that had Nicola and her friends in his sights. Detective Dallas Vaughn dedicated his life to catching killers.
Then one day he bumped into the girl-next-door, and all that changed. Now he's her White Knight fighting
against a Dark Prince . . one who would love to see her dead. Rated R for language, violence, and sexual
content.
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From reader reviews:

Martina Joseph:

This book untitled Property Of to be one of several books this best seller in this year, honestly, that is
because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this
particular book in the book shop or you can order it by way of online. The publisher with this book sells the
e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, as you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there
is no reason to your account to past this guide from your list.

Patricia Beall:

The actual book Property Of has a lot associated with on it. So when you check out this book you can get a
lot of profit. The book was published by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research just before
write this book. That book very easy to read you may get the point easily after scanning this book.

Kelly Breedlove:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with close friends is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. Just one activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition details. Even you love Property Of, you may enjoy both. It is good
combination right, you still wish to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh can happen its mind
hangout folks. What? Still don't obtain it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Thelma Atkins:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is created or printed or outlined from each source this filled update of news. Within this
modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social just like
newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can add
your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just seeking
the Property Of when you essential it?
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