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Design, implement, and publish custom Splunk applications and add-ons following best practices

About This Book

Learn advanced data enrichment techniques and create stunning data visualizations within Splunk●

Package and publish custom written apps for Splunk●

A step-by-step guide to Splunk application development with hands-on examples●

Who This Book Is For

If you are a Splunk user and want to enter the wonderful world of Splunk application development, then this
book is for you. Some experience with Splunk, writing searches, and designing basic dashboards is expected.

What You Will Learn

Implement modular input and a custom D3 data visualization●

Create a directory structure and set view permissions●

Create a search view and a dashboard view using advanced XML modules●

Enhance your application using event types, tags, and macros●

Package a Splunk application using best practices●

Publish a Splunk application to the Splunk Community●

In Detail

This book will equip you with all the necessary information to make the jump from a regular Splunk user to
an efficient Splunk application developer. It will give you an overview of Splunk applications and covers the
underpinnings of the structure and configurations that are contained within a Splunk application. You will
learn about the design fundamentals of a Splunk application, create a directory structure for your application,
and set view permissions. You will also see how to enhance your application using event types, tags, and
macros.

By the end of this book, you'll have learned how to implement advanced data input and visualizations, and
how to package and publish applications ready to deliver meaningful insights so you make better design
decisions for your business.
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From reader reviews:

Kimberly Langdon:

This book untitled Splunk Developer's Guide to be one of several books which best seller in this year, here is
because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy this particular
book in the book store or you can order it by means of online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book
too. It makes you more readily to read this book, because you can read this book in your Touch screen
phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this publication from your list.

Lois Hernandez:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, quick story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not seeking Splunk Developer's Guide that
give your pleasure preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading addiction all over the
world can be said as the method for people to know world considerably better then how they react in the
direction of the world. It can't be claimed constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky man or woman
but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for all you who want to start examining as your good
habit, you are able to pick Splunk Developer's Guide become your own personal starter.

Kelli Smith:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you might
have it in e-book method, more simple and reachable. This kind of Splunk Developer's Guide can give you a
lot of friends because by you looking at this one book you have matter that they don't and make you more
like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of one step for you to get success. This reserve offer
you information that maybe your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than additional make you to be
great persons. So , why hesitate? Let's have Splunk Developer's Guide.

Donna Gamble:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many problem for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people
likes looking at, not only science book but in addition novel and Splunk Developer's Guide or others sources
were given expertise for you. After you know how the truly amazing a book, you feel desire to read more
and more. Science e-book was created for teacher or students especially. Those guides are helping them to
increase their knowledge. In various other case, beside science reserve, any other book likes Splunk
Developer's Guide to make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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