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The Titan II ICBM (intercontinental ballistic missile) program was developed by the United States military
to bolster the size, strength, and speed of the nation's strategic weapons arsenal in the 1950s and 1960s. Each
missile carried a single warhead—the largest in U.S. inventory—used liquid fuel propellants, and was stored
and launched from hardened underground silos. The missiles were deployed at basing facilities in Arkansas,
Arizona, and Kansas and remained in active service for over twenty years. Since military deactivation in the
early 1980s, the Titan II has served as a reliable satellite launch vehicle. This is the richly detailed story of
the Titan II missile and the men and women who developed and operated the system. David K. Stumpf uses
a wide range of sources, drawing upon interviews with and memoirs by engineers and airmen as well as
recently declassified government documents and other public materials. Over 170 drawings and photographs,
most of which have never been published, enhance the narrative. The three major accidents of the program
are described in detail for the first time using authoritative sources. Titan II will be welcomed by librarians
for its prodigious reference detail, by technology history professionals and laymen, and by the many civilian
and Air Force personnel who were involved in the program—a deterrent weapons system that proved to be
successful in defending America from nuclear attack.
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From reader reviews:

Rodney Mitchell:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add your
knowledge by the guide entitled TITAN II: A History of a Cold War Missile Program. Try to the actual book
TITAN II: A History of a Cold War Missile Program as your friend. It means that it can being your friend
when you feel alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very
fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you far more confidence because you can know almost
everything by the book. So , let's make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Sharyl Nettles:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be update about what going on or details even knowledge
to make these individuals keep up with the era which can be always change and advance. Some of you
maybe will probably update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for yourself but the
problems coming to an individual is you don't know which you should start with. This TITAN II: A History
of a Cold War Missile Program is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why,
because book serves what you want and want in this era.

Valerie Herrera:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading practice give you
lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the
book this improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of reserve you
read, if you want send more knowledge just go with education books but if you want sense happy read one
along with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Often the TITAN II: A History of a Cold War
Missile Program is kind of reserve which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Mary Cruz:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
from the book. Book is created or printed or highlighted from each source this filled update of news. On this
modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can add
your understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just trying to
find the TITAN II: A History of a Cold War Missile Program when you required it?
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