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Six bestselling mystery thrillers by J.R. Rain, Steve Rollins, and A.K. Alexander, including:

DARK HORSE
When high school student Derrick Booker, the only black student at a posh Orange County high school, is
accused of killing his white girlfriend, ex-college football hero and detective Jim Knighthorse is hired to dig
a little deeper into the murder. It doesn't take long for Knighthorse to realize that not all is as it seems at
tranquil Huntington High, from a band director who preys on the innocent to a vice-principal with a secret
agenda of her own. Not to mention someone's hired a professional killer to keep Knighthorse permanently
off the case. As the investigation continues, Knighthorse's personal life is shattered by the discovery of new
evidence relating to his mother's unsolved murder, a murder dating back twenty years. Reeling from the
discovery, a determined Jim Knighthorse sets out to bring two killers to justice.

THE MUMMY CASE
Private investigator Jim Knighthorse takes on a very, very cold case. When historian Willie Clarke dies of
mysteriously of dehydration in the California deserts, ex-football hero Jim Knighthorse is hired to dig a little
deeper—and discovers a shocking connection to one of the West's oldest mysteries. Over a hundred years
ago, an unnamed cowboy was murdered in the California desert and, due to freak weather conditions, would
become mummified within twenty-four hours. Now known to the world as Sylvester the Mummy and
displayed in a creepy curiosity shop, Sylvester and historian Willie Clarke will be forever linked in mystery.
That is, unless private investigator Jim Knighthorse can survive long enough to untangle one of the West's
greatest unsolved murders.

WINTER WIND
Five years ago, Lee Jordan was nearly killed on the job. Now deaf, blind, and mute, he's recovered enough to
live a routine but silent life. However, now, the LAPD needs him back...When the cases of many missing
persons are tied together with the same M.O., Lee is called in to help locate people who seemingly walked
away from their everyday lives. But did they? Lee's only assets are his guide dog, fourteen years of
experience as a homicide detective—and an intriguing American Sign Language translator named Rachel.
Just as Lee begins to discover something remarkable about himself, he must engage in a battle of wits with a
murderer he can't see or hear. With no weapons but his own mind—and a guide dog with a heart of gold—he
sets off alone in Los Angeles to investigate the disappearances.

HEAR NO EVIL
Audial telepath Kylie Cain works for a black ops branch of the CIA. Now tasked with the biggest challenge
of her life when a faction of rogue operatives who call themselves WON (World Order Now) kidnap eleven-
year-old Hope Mitchell, a powerful girl who may be the link to other worlds, Kylie feels immediately drawn
to the girl’s energy, and vows to save her. Kylie’s elite team of psychic spies soon discover that not only is
Hope Mitchell an audial telepath, too, but the girl has another special gift—a gift that could change the
courses of the past, present and future. A gift that could open up worlds...and destroy them.

STORMY WEATHER
Storm Donovan is a prominent Manhattan lawyer with the knack and the know-how for doing his own case
investigations. While involved in the defense of a rebellious pop star on a drunk driving charge, he crosses



paths with her beautiful, but married, public relations agent. Meanwhile, Albert Parker, his friend and former
FBI partner, investigates the barbaric, ritualistic murder of a man with ties to Storm’s past—and a tragedy he
would rather forget.

STORMY NIGHT
A robbery of a Federal Reserve Bank. A defendant who can’t testify. One hell of a defense lawyer.
Manhattan attorney Storm Donovan craves a legal challenge, but an investigation into the seamy underworld
of federal crime and punishment just might be the death of him.
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From reader reviews:

Danny Nehring:

The book Crime After Crime: Six Mystery Thrillers can give more knowledge and information about
everything you want. Why then must we leave a very important thing like a book Crime After Crime: Six
Mystery Thrillers? Wide variety you have a different opinion about book. But one aim which book can give
many information for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer together with your book.
Knowledge or data that you take for that, you can give for each other; you could share all of these. Book
Crime After Crime: Six Mystery Thrillers has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and massive
function for you. You can appear the enormous world by wide open and read a reserve. So it is very
wonderful.

Nakia Schultz:

Now a day people who Living in the era where everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not require people to be aware of each information they get. How many
people to be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Reading
through a book can help people out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Crime After Crime: Six
Mystery Thrillers book as this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the details in this book
hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you may already know.

Edward Florez:

Is it an individual who having spare time and then spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Crime After Crime: Six Mystery
Thrillers can be the answer, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are so out of date, spending your
time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the
others?

Jenna Quintana:

Many people said that they feel weary when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the item when
they get a half parts of the book. You can choose the book Crime After Crime: Six Mystery Thrillers to make
your current reading is interesting. Your skill of reading talent is developing when you just like reading. Try
to choose easy book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the impression about book and studying
especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to available a book and examine it. Beside that the e-book
Crime After Crime: Six Mystery Thrillers can to be a newly purchased friend when you're feel alone and
confuse using what must you're doing of their time.
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