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""Isfahan is half the world"" was the proud boast of the 17th-century capital of Persia, established as the new
political centre of the country by Shah Abbas I shortly after his accession to the throne in 1588.

One of the many travellers attracted to Persia by these claims was Jean Chardin, a young French jeweller
who spent a total of 10 years in Isfahan. During this time, he became intimately familiar with the city, its
markets, shops, and workplaces; he was invited into people's houses and entertained; he visited gardens and
participated in hunts; his knowledge of Court affairs was extensive; and he travelled hundreds of miles, all
over the country, visiting other towns and villages.

His journals are a source of information for all interested in Middle Eastern history. They also provide a
portrait of life both at court and among humble artisans in 17th century Persia. First published as ""Chardin's
Voyages"", this edited collection includes a comprehensive introduction with a biography of Chardin and a
description of Iran in the mid-17th-century, placing the writing in its historical context.
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From reader reviews:

Roy Christy:

This A Journey To Persia: Jean Chardin's Portrait of a Seventeenth-Century Empire tend to be reliable for
you who want to be considered a successful person, why. The key reason why of this A Journey To Persia:
Jean Chardin's Portrait of a Seventeenth-Century Empire can be on the list of great books you must have is
actually giving you more than just simple reading through food but feed anyone with information that
probably will shock your previous knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it all over the
place and whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed people. Beside that this A Journey To Persia:
Jean Chardin's Portrait of a Seventeenth-Century Empire forcing you to have an enormous of experience
including rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that we understand it useful in your day
activity. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Esther Tackett:

The reserve untitled A Journey To Persia: Jean Chardin's Portrait of a Seventeenth-Century Empire is the e-
book that recommended to you to study. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to
you. The language that author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The
copy writer was did a lot of investigation when write the book, and so the information that they share for you
is absolutely accurate. You also could possibly get the e-book of A Journey To Persia: Jean Chardin's
Portrait of a Seventeenth-Century Empire from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Roger Patrick:

Precisely why? Because this A Journey To Persia: Jean Chardin's Portrait of a Seventeenth-Century Empire
is an unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap that but latter it will distress you
with the secret that inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who have write the book in such
amazing way makes the content on the inside easier to understand, entertaining method but still convey the
meaning totally. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This
amazing book will give you a lot of advantages than the other book get such as help improving your
proficiency and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I had been you
I will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Sheila Dickerson:

E-book is one of source of understanding. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students and
also native or citizen want book to know the change information of year to be able to year. As we know
those books have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the
world. Through the book A Journey To Persia: Jean Chardin's Portrait of a Seventeenth-Century Empire we
can get more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? Being creative person must love to read
a book. Only choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life with this book



A Journey To Persia: Jean Chardin's Portrait of a Seventeenth-Century Empire. You can more attractive than
now.
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