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The design of today's semiconductor chips for various applications, such as telecommunications, poses
various challenges due to the complexity of these systems. These highly complex systems-on-chips demand
new approaches to connect and manage the communication between on-chip processing and storage
components and networks on chips (NoCs) provide a powerful solution.

This book is the first to provide a unified overview of NoC technology. It includes in-depth analysis of all
the on-chip communication challenges, from physical wiring implementation up to software architecture, and
a complete classification of their various Network-on-Chip approaches and solutions.

* Leading-edge research from world-renowned experts in academia and industry with state-of-the-art
technology implementations/trends
* An integrated presentation not currently available in any other book
* A thorough introduction to current design methodologies and chips designed with NoCs
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From reader reviews:

Anna Brooks:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their spare time with their family, or
their very own friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic within
the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to fill
your current free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book could be option to fill your free of charge time/
holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you want to try
out look for book, may be the publication untitled Networks on Chips: Technology and Tools (Systems on
Silicon) can be fine book to read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Judith Cole:

Is it anyone who having spare time and then spend it whole day by means of watching television programs or
just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This Networks on Chips: Technology and Tools
(Systems on Silicon) can be the respond to, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are so out of date,
spending your time by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these ebooks have
than the others?

Eric Hempel:

As we know that book is important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This e-book Networks on Chips: Technology and Tools (Systems on Silicon)
was filled regarding science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your research competence.
Some people has distinct feel when they reading some sort of book. If you know how big advantage of a
book, you can sense enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book you
wanted.

Sophie Clark:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from the book. Book is written or printed or outlined from each source that will filled update of
news. With this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for an individual.
From media social like newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, book and
comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book?
Or just looking for the Networks on Chips: Technology and Tools (Systems on Silicon) when you necessary
it?
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