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Philosophy, as Aristotle said, originates in wonder; and non-human animals have long been a source of
wonder to humans. This is especially evident in the question what treatment the former deserve by the latter.
Western philosophy has been concerned with the way in which we ought to treat non-human animals since
its very origins in pre-Socratic philosophy. Even nowadays animal ethics continues to be a highly
challenging field and one of the liveliest areas of debate within ethics. It is a controversial subject that has
sparked a range of new and exciting debates, but it has also led to the renewed exploration of long-standing
philosophical issues with innovative approaches. This book offers both the presentation and discussion of a
range of influential past approaches to animal ethics and an equally significant range of contemporary ones.
To get a full view of the complex field of animal ethics, we need to understand the philosophical legacy of
the past and the resources it offers while also forging new views that consider our increasingly developed
understanding of the nature of non-human animals. The volume includes contributions by celebrated
philosopher Peter Singer, animal rights activist and philosopher Steven Best, and many more. The volume
contains articles by George Arabatzis, Steven Best, Stephen R. L. Clark, Myrto Dragona-Monachou,
Warwick Fox, Gary L. Francione, Xavier Labbée, Panagiotis Pantazakos, Filimon Peonidis, Evangelos D.
Protopapadakis, Tom Regan, Mark J. Rowlands, Roger Scruton, Peter Singer, Gary Steiner, and Georgios
Steiris.
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From reader reviews:

Irene Vaughan:

Book is definitely written, printed, or created for everything. You can learn everything you want by a guide.
Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important thing to bring us around the world. Close
to that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A guide Animal Ethics: Past and Present Perspectives
will make you to become smarter. You can feel a lot more confidence if you can know about anything. But
some of you think that will open or reading any book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they might
be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or appropriate book with you?

Angela Drew:

The actual book Animal Ethics: Past and Present Perspectives has a lot details on it. So when you check out
this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was compiled by the very famous author. This articles author
makes some research just before write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you may get the point
easily after reading this article book.

Jonathan Smith:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this Animal Ethics: Past and Present
Perspectives reserve written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book which might be
understand by anyone who read the book. Written in good manner for you, dripping every ideas and
producing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still doubt Animal Ethics: Past and Present
Perspectives as good book not simply by the cover but also through the content. This is one reserve that can
break don't judge book by its include, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to pick this particular!?
Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Curt Stewart:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind talent
or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book than can satisfy
your short time to read it because this all time you only find guide that need more time to be go through.
Animal Ethics: Past and Present Perspectives can be your answer because it can be read by you who have
those short free time problems.
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