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On 6 June 1944 British, American, Canadian and French troops landed in Normandy by air and sea. This was
one of the key moments of the Second World War, a long-anticipated invasion which would, ultimately, lead
to the defeat of Nazi Germany. By the day’s end a lodgment had been effected and Operation OVERLORD
was being hailed as a success.

In reality the assault had produced mixed results and at certain points along the French coastline the position
was still far from certain. The key Allied objectives had also not been captured during the first day of the
fighting and this failure would have long-term consequences. Of the priority targets, the city of Caen was a
vital logistical hub with its road and rail networks plus it would also act as a critical axis for launching the
anticipated follow-on attacks against the German defenders. As a result an entire brigade of British troops
was tasked with attempting its capture but their advance culminated a few miles short.

This new book examines this significant element of the wider D-Day operation and provides a narrative
account of the operations conducted by 3 British Infantry Division. It examines in some detail the planning,
preparation and the landings that were made on the beaches of Sword sector. To do this it considers the
previously published material and also draws upon archival sources many of which have been previously
overlooked to identify key factors behind the failure to capture the city. Its publication coincides with the
70th anniversary of the Allied liberation of France.

REVIEWS

“ … Stewart’s evaluation of the battle for Sword Beach is excellent. His operational insight and ability to
seamlessly flow into a tactical narrative make this a battlefield study of some significant worth … Stewart is
to be commended and Helion has published another quality book well worth the investment.” War
HistoryOnline

This is by far the best analysis of the 3rd Division’s actions of D-Day this reviewer has ever read … Most
highly recommended.”
“Society of Friends of the National Army Museum Book Review Supplement

… The book provides an extremely enjoyable and illuminating description of the events and activities of the
3 Br Inf Div which adds a significant degree of granularity to the events that occurred on Sword Beach and
further inland on D-Day. By giving the reader insight into the various factors that influenced Brigadier
Smith’s thinking, Caen Controversy has opened up areas for further study and discussion.” Canadian
Military History
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From reader reviews:

Shawn Francis:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this Caen Controversy: The Battle for Sword
Beach 1944 publication written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book that can be
understand by anyone who also read the book. Written inside good manner for you, leaking every ideas and
composing skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then you still hesitation Caen Controversy: The
Battle for Sword Beach 1944 as good book not only by the cover but also with the content. This is one e-
book that can break don't assess book by its deal with, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to
pick this specific!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to
yet another sixth sense.

Earnest Moss:

This Caen Controversy: The Battle for Sword Beach 1944 is great e-book for you because the content that is
full of information for you who always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This
book reveal it data accurately using great manage word or we can say no rambling sentences included. So if
you are read the idea hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight
forward sentences but tough core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having Caen Controversy:
The Battle for Sword Beach 1944 in your hand like finding the world in your arm, information in it is not
ridiculous one. We can say that no reserve that offer you world with ten or fifteen small right but this reserve
already do that. So , this can be good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt that will?

Benita Newton:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you will get it in
e-book technique, more simple and reachable. This specific Caen Controversy: The Battle for Sword Beach
1944 can give you a lot of buddies because by you considering this one book you have point that they don't
and make a person more like an interesting person. This book can be one of a step for you to get success.
This guide offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than other
make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? We should have Caen Controversy: The Battle for Sword
Beach 1944.

Ryan Moore:

As a student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library as
well as to make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's
internal or real their interest. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go to there
but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring along with can't see
colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we
know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, ways to



reach Chinese's country. So , this Caen Controversy: The Battle for Sword Beach 1944 can make you feel
more interested to read.
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