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A Harvard-trained obstetrician-gynecologist, prominent blogger, and author of the classic How Your Baby Is
Born delivers a timely, important, and sure to be headline-making expose that shines a light on the natural
parenting movement and the multimillion-dollar industry behind it.

The natural parenting movement praises the virtues of birth without medical interference, staunchly
advocates breastfeeding for all mothers, and hails attachment parenting. Once the exclusive province of the
alternative lifestyle, natural parenting has gone mainstream, becoming a lucrative big business today.

But those who do not subscribe to this method are often made to feel as if they are doing their children harm.
Dr. Amy Tuteur understands their apprehensions. “Parenting quickly feels synonymous with guilt. And of
late, there is no bigger arena for this pervasive guilt than childbirth.” As a medical professional with a long
career in obstetrics and gynecology and as the mother of four children, Tuteur is no stranger to the
insurmountable pressures and subsequent feelings of blame and self-condemnation that mothers experience
during their children’s early years. The natural parenting movement, she contends, is not helping them raise
their children better. Instead, it capitalizes on their uncertainty, manipulating parents when they are most
vulnerable.

In Push Back, she chronicles the movement’s history from its roots to its modern practices, incorporating her
own experiences as a mother and successful OB-GYN with original research on the latest in childbirth
science. She also reveals the dangerous and overtly misogynistic motives of some of its
proponents—conservative men who sought to limit women’s control and autonomy. As she debunks, one by
one, the guilt-inducing myths of natural birth and parenting, Dr. Tuteur empowers women to embrace the
method of childbirth that is right for them, while reassuring all parents that the most important thing they can
do is love and care for their children.
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From reader reviews:

Micheal Taylor:

Here thing why this particular Push Back: Guilt in the Age of Natural Parenting are different and reputable to
be yours. First of all examining a book is good but it really depends in the content from it which is the
content is as scrumptious as food or not. Push Back: Guilt in the Age of Natural Parenting giving you
information deeper as different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no guide that similar
with Push Back: Guilt in the Age of Natural Parenting. It gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your
own eyes about the thing that will happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. It is
possible to bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your means home by train. Should you be having
difficulties in bringing the imprinted book maybe the form of Push Back: Guilt in the Age of Natural
Parenting in e-book can be your alternative.

Richard Dutton:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider when those information which is within the former life are challenging be find than now is taking
seriously which one would work to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you have
the unstable resource then you buy it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All
of those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Push Back: Guilt in the Age of Natural Parenting
as the daily resource information.

Belinda Tenney:

This book untitled Push Back: Guilt in the Age of Natural Parenting to be one of several books in which best
seller in this year, here is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will
easily to buy this kind of book in the book retail store or you can order it by means of online. The publisher
with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, as you can read this book in your
Smart phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this guide from your list.

Allison Lyon:

The e-book untitled Push Back: Guilt in the Age of Natural Parenting is the e-book that recommended to you
to see. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to you actually. The language
that creator use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The copy writer was did a
lot of research when write the book, to ensure the information that they share to you personally is absolutely
accurate. You also will get the e-book of Push Back: Guilt in the Age of Natural Parenting from the
publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.
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