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Restructured Electric Power Systems: Analysis of Electricity Markets with Equilibrium Models
The latest practical applications of electricity market equilibrium models in analyzing electricity
markets

Electricity market deregulation is driving the power energy production from a monopolistic structure into a
competitive market environment. The development of electricity markets has necessitated the need to
analyze market behavior and power. Restructured Electric Power Systems reviews the latest developments in
electricity market equilibrium models and discusses the application of such models in the practical analysis
and assessment of electricity markets.

Drawing upon the extensive involvement in the research and industrial development of the leading experts in
the subject area, the book starts by explaining the current developments of electrical power systems towards
smart grids and then relates the operation and control technologies to the aspects in electricity markets. It
explores:

The problems of electricity market behavior and market power●

Mathematical programs with equilibrium constraints (MPEC) and equilibrium problems with equilibrium●

constraints (EPEC)
Tools and techniques for solving the electricity market equilibrium problems●

Various electricity market equilibrium models●

State-of-the-art techniques for computing the electricity market equilibrium problems●

The application of electricity market equilibrium models in assessing the economic benefits of transmission●

expansions for market environments, forward and spot markets, short-term power system security, and
analysis of reactive power impact

Also featured are computational resources to allow readers to develop algorithms on their own, as well as
future research directions in modeling and computational techniques in electricity market analysis.
Restructured Electric Power Systems is an invaluable reference for electrical engineers and power system
economists from power utilities and for professors, postgraduate students, and undergraduate students in
electrical power engineering, as well as those responsible for the design, engineering, research, and
development of competitive electricity markets and electricity market policy.
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From reader reviews:

Tonya Sewell:

The book Restructured Electric Power Systems: Analysis of Electricity Markets with Equilibrium Models
can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Why then must we leave the best
thing like a book Restructured Electric Power Systems: Analysis of Electricity Markets with Equilibrium
Models? Wide variety you have a different opinion about book. But one aim in which book can give many
facts for us. It is absolutely correct. Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or info that you
take for that, you can give for each other; you could share all of these. Book Restructured Electric Power
Systems: Analysis of Electricity Markets with Equilibrium Models has simple shape nevertheless, you know:
it has great and large function for you. You can search the enormous world by wide open and read a reserve.
So it is very wonderful.

George Clark:

This book untitled Restructured Electric Power Systems: Analysis of Electricity Markets with Equilibrium
Models to be one of several books in which best seller in this year, that is because when you read this reserve
you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the book retail store or you
can order it by using online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read
this book, since you can read this book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason to you personally to past
this publication from your list.

Charles Felton:

Is it an individual who having spare time and then spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This Restructured Electric Power
Systems: Analysis of Electricity Markets with Equilibrium Models can be the respond to, oh how comes? It's
a book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your time by reading in this fresh era is
common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than the others?

Filiberto Dacosta:

A lot of guide has printed but it differs. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the most
beneficial book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is identified as
of book Restructured Electric Power Systems: Analysis of Electricity Markets with Equilibrium Models.
Contain your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it may add your knowledge and
make a person happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from
one location to other place.
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