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Humans perceive the three-dimensional structure of the world with apparent ease. However, despite all of the
recent advances in computer vision research, the dream of having a computer interpret an image at the same
level as a two-year old remains elusive. Why is computer vision such a challenging problem and what is the
current state of the art?Computer Vision: Algorithms and Applications explores the variety of techniques
commonly used to analyze and interpret images. It also describes challenging real-world applications where
vision is being successfully used, both for specialized applications such as medical imaging, and for fun,
consumer-level tasks such as image editing and stitching, which students can apply to their own personal
photos and videos.More than just a source of “recipes,” this exceptionally authoritative and comprehensive
textbook/reference also takes a scientific approach to basic vision problems, formulating physical models of
the imaging process before inverting them to produce descriptions of a scene. These problems are also
analyzed using statistical models and solved using rigorous engineering techniquesTopics and features:
structured to support active curricula and project-oriented courses, with tips in the Introduction for using the
book in a variety of customized courses; presents exercises at the end of each chapter with a heavy emphasis
on testing algorithms and containing numerous suggestions for small mid-term projects; provides additional
material and more detailed mathematical topics in the Appendices, which cover linear algebra, numerical
techniques, and Bayesian estimation theory; suggests additional reading at the end of each chapter, including
the latest research in each sub-field, in addition to a full Bibliography at the end of the book; supplies
supplementary course material for students at the associated website, http://szeliski.org/Book/.Suitable for an
upper-level undergraduate or graduate-level course in computer science or engineering, this textbook focuses
on basic techniques that work under real-world conditions and encourages students to push their creative
boundaries. Its design and exposition also make it eminently suitable as a unique reference to the
fundamental techniques and current research literature in computer vision.
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From reader reviews:

Jules Thompson:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place
and notice by means of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated it for a
while is reading. Yeah, by reading a book your ability to survive improve then having chance to endure than
other is high. For yourself who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this kind of Computer
Vision (Texts in Computer Science) book as beginning and daily reading book. Why, because this book is
usually more than just a book.

Jason Nunez:

The ability that you get from Computer Vision (Texts in Computer Science) is a more deep you searching
the information that hide inside words the more you get interested in reading it. It doesn't mean that this book
is hard to comprehend but Computer Vision (Texts in Computer Science) giving you excitement feeling of
reading. The author conveys their point in selected way that can be understood simply by anyone who read
the idea because the author of this book is well-known enough. This book also makes your own personal
vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book style
are available. We propose you for having this Computer Vision (Texts in Computer Science) instantly.

Jeff Weaver:

The book Computer Vision (Texts in Computer Science) will bring you to the new experience of reading a
new book. The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book you just
read, this book very ideal to you. The book Computer Vision (Texts in Computer Science) is much
recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can more readily
to read the book.

Ada Peterson:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always aim to and must have the time or they will get large
amount of stress from both daily life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity have
you got when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then ever
try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, typically the
book you have read will be Computer Vision (Texts in Computer Science).
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