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A love that cannot be bought or sold proves to be the greatest gift of all, in this heartwarming classic that
demonstrates once again why New York Times bestselling author Mary Balogh is among the most celebrated
authors of historical romance.

Weddings are supposed to be joyous occasions—especially when a couple seems as well matched as
Randolph Pierce, Earl of Falloden, and his bride-to-be, Eleanor Transome. Ellie brings to the marriage a vast
dowry, while Falloden, though distant, is handsome, tremendously desirable, and possessed of a title most
young ladies can only dream of sharing.

Yet Ellie is not most young ladies. She knows that she must honor her dear father’s dying wish for her to
wed the proud earl, but she dreads a lifetime in a union without love—and how can Falloden claim to love
her when he married her only for her fortune? As Christmas descends upon the Falloden manor, the warmth
of the season may yet melt away the trappings of duty and wealth, leaving behind only a man and a woman
destined for each other’s arms.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Crumrine:

This A Christmas Promise usually are reliable for you who want to become a successful person, why. The
reason of this A Christmas Promise can be one of the great books you must have is usually giving you more
than just simple looking at food but feed you actually with information that perhaps will shock your previous
knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and whenever your
conditions in e-book and printed ones. Beside that this A Christmas Promise forcing you to have an
enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical thinking that we understand
it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Debra Sims:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to opt for book like
comic, small story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not trying A Christmas Promise that give
your fun preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading addiction all over the world can
be said as the way for people to know world a great deal better then how they react in the direction of the
world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading routine only for the geeky individual but for all of you
who wants to possibly be success person. So , for all you who want to start reading through as your good
habit, you are able to pick A Christmas Promise become your personal starter.

Michael Carr:

You are able to spend your free time to study this book this reserve. This A Christmas Promise is simple to
bring you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not possess much
space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it.
You can save typically the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will
get when one buys this book.

Jonathan Zahn:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got scholars? We believe that that
question was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby.
So you know that little person including reading or as reading through become their hobby. You must know
that reading is very important as well as book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to include you
knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update concerning something by
book. Different categories of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is actually A Christmas
Promise.
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