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• The most comprehensive urgent care textbook on the market to date • Edited and authored by recognized
leaders in urgent care education • Focuses on the unique challenges of the urgent care setting • Covers pearls
& pitfalls, from triage to disposition. Topics Include: Neurologic Urgencies, Facial Droop, Headache,
Vertigo, Acute Focal Neurologic Deficit, Head Injury: Altered Mental Status; Heat / Cold Urgencies; Head,
Eye, Ear, Nose / Throat Urgencies; Epistaxis, Acute Eye Trauma, Acute Vision Loss, The Acute
Nontraumatic Red Eye, Otitis Media, Sinusitis, Dental Injuries / Pain, Sore Throat, Respiratory Urgencies,
Wheezing / Asthma, Dyspnea, Respiratory Tract Infections, Acute Exacerbations of Chronic Bronchitis,
Cardiac Urgencies, Syncope, Chest Pain, Palpitations, Peripheral Edema, Nausea, Vomiting / Diarrhea,
Abdominal Pain, Gastrointestinal Bleeding, Genitourinary Urgencies, Dysuria / Urinary Tract Infections in
Adult / Pediatric Patients, Flank Pain and Kidney Stones; Orthopedic, Environmental, and Traumatic
Urgencies; Neck Pain, Ankle / Foot Pain / Injury, Lower Extremity Pain / Injury, Shoulder / Upper Extremity
Pain / Injury, Hand / Wrist Pain / Injury, Chest Wall / Other Thoracic Trauma, Facial Injuries, Laceration
Repair / Wound Management, Needlesticks, Insect Bites / Stings, Back Pain, Gynecologic and Obstetric
Urgencies, Vaginal Bleeding, Sexually Transmitted Infections, Dermatologic Urgencies, Common
Dermatologic Conditions, Urticaria / Angioedema, Skin / Soft-Tissue Infections, Contact Dermatitis, Burns,
Pediatric Urgencies: Respiratory Difficulty, Vomiting / Diarrhea, Upper Respiratory Infections, Abdominal
Pain, Limp, Upper / Lower Extremity Injuries, Fever Without a Source, Foreign Bodies, Excessive Crying in
Infants; Toxicologic and Medication-Related Urgencies, The Drug-Seeking Patient, Toxicologic Urgencies,
Anaphylaxis, Nonspecific Urgencies, Fatigue / Generalized Weakness, Mental Health Urgencies, Psychiatric
Urgencies
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From reader reviews:

Doris Moreno:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also be a life style. This reading behavior give you lot of
advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge your information inside the book that will improve
your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of guide you read, if you want get
more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want experience happy read one using theme for
entertaining for instance comic or novel. Typically the Textbook of Urgent Care Medicine Paperback
Unabridged, 2014 is kind of guide which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Judith Duncan:

This book untitled Textbook of Urgent Care Medicine Paperback Unabridged, 2014 to be one of several
books in which best seller in this year, that's because when you read this publication you can get a lot of
benefit in it. You will easily to buy this particular book in the book shop or you can order it by means of
online. The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more readily to read this book, as you
can read this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this guide
from your list.

Michelle Huffman:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will
make anyone to understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and soon.
You can observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended for you is Textbook of Urgent Care Medicine Paperback Unabridged, 2014 this guide consist
a lot of the information from the condition of this world now. This specific book was represented just how
can the world has grown up. The language styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand.
Typically the writer made some study when he makes this book. This is why this book ideal all of you.

Jodie Jennings:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you might have it in e-
book means, more simple and reachable. This kind of Textbook of Urgent Care Medicine Paperback
Unabridged, 2014 can give you a lot of buddies because by you looking at this one book you have issue that
they don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. That book can be one of one step for you
to get success. This reserve offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't understand, by knowing
more than some other make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? Let's have Textbook of
Urgent Care Medicine Paperback Unabridged, 2014.
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